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Resolution No. 21-23

The Logan County Board of Commissioners met in regular open session on this date of January 24, 2023 with the
full board present.

Mr. Mark Robinson moved that the following resolution be adopted:
RE: AWARD BID-2023 AGGREGATE (STONE)-LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER
WHEREAS, bids were received on January 19, 2023, for 2023 Aggregate (stone), and

WHEREAS, bids were received from Shelly Material, Duff Quarry, Neers Sand and Gravel and these bids have
been reviewed by the Logan County Engineer, and

WHEREAS, the Logan County Engineer recommends that due to the small differential in cost and the location of
the bidder’s plants in our county, and to authorize.Logan County Engineer to purchase necessary aggregate from each of
the suppliers based upon cost, length of haul to job site and availability of material at the time of project requirement.

THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED by the Logan County Board of Commissioners to authorize the
Logan County Engineer to purchase necessary aggregated from each of the suppliers based upon cost, length of haul to
job site and availability of material at time of the project requirement.

Mr. Michael E. Yoder seconded the motic;n.

Roll call resulted as follows:

.%r. }oe Antram, Pfesident Z 3
Mr.Mi/ %ae_lE.Yodeéa Vice President é

%Markf Robinsén, Member ;/:g

I, De De Doss, Clerk/Administrator, hereby certify this to be a true copy of the proceedings as taken from the
minutes of the meeting of the Logan County Commissioners on this date of January 24, 2023.

De De Doss, Administrative Clerk



OFFICE OF THE
LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER
P.O. BOX 427
1991 COUNTY ROAD 13
BELLEFONTAINE, OH 43311

wew.lceo.ns

SCOTT C. COLEMAN, P.E., PS. Telephone: (937) 592-2791
LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER Fax: (937) 599-2658
Tanuary 20, 2023

APPROVED BY THE BOARD OF
LOGAN OUNTY COMMISHIUNERS

e

: MOTION ! —
E’l;;l;%lg;ﬁ:e (L‘Bo{:xalrﬁc}ig:ionﬁrg Zi;g PmﬂM— ——1—? _ —__—
Belletontsine, OFL 45311 S | 71 1
Re:  Agpregate (Stone) Bids for 2023

Janu ay 19, 2023 at 10:00 AM.
Gentlemen:

Attached is a tabulation of bids received by your honoreble board on Jamwary 19, 2023 for
aggregate to be used by the Highway Department during 2023,

Due to the small differential in cost and the location of the bidder's plants in our county, I
recommend that your honorablé board adopt a resolution authorizing our department to purchase
necessary aggregate from each of the suppliers based upon cost, length of haul to job site and
availability of material at the time of project requirement.

Tn accordance with ORC 9.24, we have checked the Auditor of State’s Unresolved Findings for
Recovery Database and the federal system for awards management. The respongive bidders
were not listed and we have retained the certified search confirmation pages in the project file.

Respectfully submitted,

Awﬁz‘/—/’"

Scott C. Coleman, P E., P.5.
Logan County Engineer

SCChwtb

Attachment




2023 STONE BID CHART - BID DATE: JANUARY 19, 2023
SHELLY DURF 4 NEER'S
AGOREGATE SIZE |UNIT MATERIAY, Quarry Sand and Gravel
Belle Center
No. 1 TON '$30,00
[NO. 2 TON $12.50 $1423 $.1.5.00
NO. 4 TON $£12.50 $1435 :éa{:.rm
NO. 422-A TON No Bid No Bid " HNoBid
hNO. 6 TON | $15.00 §1525 |- 51500
fNO, 67 TON No Bid $16.25 Mo PBid
INO. 8 TON $25.00 w2175 | $15.00
0.9 TON $11.75 $13.25 No Bid
JNO. 310 TON No Bid $1425 Ne Bid
fNO. 304 TON $15.00 $14.25 $15.00
Ll'J-:). 617 TON $15.00 §14.25 §15.00
QUARRY ROCK. TON No Bid No Bid No Bid
|FLAT ROCK TON No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
ICE GRITS TON No Bid B13.25 Mo Bid
BANE. RUN GRAVEL |TON o Bid No Bid §12.00
BOULDERS TON No Bid No Bid £150.00
RIP RAP A, B, C,D |TON $32.00 $29.50 No Bid




Jan 16 , 2023

Gentlemen:

We hereby submit the following bids for products produced af out plant located at 4859 TWD Rd 45
Bellefontaine forthe year 2023.

These prices are for the merchandise F.O.B. your trucks as follows:

STONE & GRAVEL PRODUCTS
Mo 1 _‘ $ 30,00 peér ton
No.2 $15.00 jper ton
No. 4 $ 30.98 per lan
No. 49 Crusghed $ 15.00 pe- ton
No.6 f57 $ 15,00 per ton
No o $ 25.00 per ton
No. 8 ¥ 95.00 pEer ton
No. ' Concrete Mix $ 20.00 pex ton
No411 14" minus 40% crusied 14.00 per ton
No. 617 $15.00 peron
| No. :304B 2"_dust 100% crdghed 15.00 per ton
OTHER. SIZES PRODUCED
‘Fill Dirt $£12.00 - per ton
¢oncrete Sand 02 ¥ 20.00 per ton
| Maspn Sand {3 $ 35.00 per ton
Bank Run §12.00 per ton
Boulders $ 150.00 . perton
1. Thq Logain Coriily Engiect e Yehest gt S ilivibal giadgticiioet

Chiigbeal Sié verifying sieve analysia with the ODOT2019'CMS i(Type )

3.4 CMS 422,02 - i i festion forashod aggicipls Ry be watved i e
higve meetrequitement.
3. Cumrently The Logan County Engineer estimates the quantity of 422-A chipseal stone for the 2023 program to
be 6,500 tons. -
Respectfully submitied,

Company Neer's Sand & Gravel LLC By: Arden J Neer Jr
Address 4859 Twp RA 45 Title: Partner

Bellefontaine OH 43311 Telephone No. _937-585-6733




COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S
PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT
LOGAN COUNTY, OHIO (R.C. 5719.042)
STATE OF OHIO:
-
LOGAN COUNTY :

The nndersigned, being duly sworr, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in,
or with Logan County, Ohio, and that: (Check appropriate lines)

He is a sole proprictorship doing buginess under his own name.

¥e ia a sole proprietorship doing business under the name of

% He is a peneral pariner of the partnership known as Heer 's Sand & Gravel LLC

He is a duly authorized officer of the corporation named

The business address of the bidderis 4852 Twp Rd 45 Bellefontaine OH 43311

; Telephone 937-585-6733

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid:
‘Was not charped with any delinguent personal taxes in Logan County, Ohio.

Was charged with delinquent personal property taxes as fallows:

YEAR AMOUNT  PENALTY INTERBST
20 $ 5 $
20 $ $ $
20 $ $ : $

Signed:

Title: Partner




STATE OF OHIO:
;&8
LOGAN COUNTY :
Before me, a notary, in and for said county, personally appeared

Arden J Neer Jr {(sole proprietor doing business under his own name)

(sole proprietor doing business under the name of )

(general partoer of the Partnership known as Neer's Sand & Gravel LLC )

»

{duly authorized officer of the Corporation name by

who acknowledged that he is authorized in the premises and that his signing of this instrument is
the free sct and deed of himself or the organization which he represents.

In testimony whereof, I have hereunto subscribed my name and affixed my officiel seal at

Bellefontaines Ohio, this 16 16 dayof January ,'2023
/ Sandra Adams
N ol ia ﬁz A vams Notary Publie, Stale of Ohio -
Publi .ommission Explres Tew 7, 20 o
Notary Public tecorded In Legan,
COMMISSIONERS;

No delinquent taxes — file
Dejinguent taxes - sent to Comnty Engineer

Clerk




NOTICE FOR BIDS

Notice is hereby given that bids will be received st the Logan County Commissioners Office, 117 E.
Columbus Avenue, Suite 100, Bellefontaine, Ohio nntil 11:00 A.M., Ohio Standard Time, Thursday,
January 19, 2023 for the furnishing of commercially produced STONE AND GRAVEL of various sizes
required for the general construction and maintenance of Logan County Highways during ihe year 2023
according to specifications on file in the Logan County Commissioner's Office,

Bids accepted on furnished blanks only.

Specifications and blanks may be obtained at the Logan County Commissioner's Office.
Bids to be submitted on a unit price basis.

Propogals are to be a FIRM FIX PRICE FOR A PERIOD OF ONT YEAR from the award date.
Bids to be submitted on F.O.B. our trucks basis. . ‘

Bids will be awarded to lowest and best bidder taking into consideration, haul distance and route, typs of
proposed project, and availability of material, c

Bidders must comply with the provisions of the American with Disabilities Act of 1990,
All proposals to be in accordance with Sections 307.86 to 307.92 inclusive of the Chio Revised Code.

Aggregate products shall conform to the Construction and Material Specifications of the State of Ohio,
dated January 1, 2019,

The Notice to Bidders is posted on the Intemet and may be viewed on Logan County’s web page at:

www Iceo.usfengineer/Bid Documents/index. himl

The Logan County Board of Commissioners reserves the right to reject any and all bids and fo waive any
defects in bids.

Board of County Commissioners
Logan County, Ohio
DeDe Doss, Clerk/Admin.

Posted: January 05, 2023
Advertised:  January 05, 2023; Januvary 12, 2023




Gentlemen:

January 2, 2023

We hereby submit the following bids for products produced at out plant located at 9016 State Route
117m Huntsville, OH 43324 for the year 2023.

These prices are for the merchandise F.O.B. your trucks as follows;

STONE & GRAVEL PRODUCTS
No. 1 $NO BID per ton
No.2 $14.25 per ton
No. 4 $14,25 per ton
No. 422 -A $NO BID per tont
No. 6 $15.25 per tont
No. 67 $16.25 per ton
No. 8 32175 per ton
No. 9 $13.25 per ton
No. 310 $14.25 per ton
No. 304 $1425 per ton
No. 617 $14.25 per ton
RipRap (A,B,C &) $26.50 per ton
OTHER S1ZES PROIMCED
Ice Grits $13.25 per ton
Qeatry Rock $NO BID per ton
Flat Rock fNO BID per ton
Bank Ryun $NO BID per ton
Boulders FNO BID per ton
NOTE: .
1. The Logzan County Engineer may request up to 5 individual gradation test on the stockpiled No. 422-A
chipseal stone verifying sieve analysis with the ODOT 2019 CMS 422.02-1 (Type A) for material acceptance.
2. CMS 422.02 - the specification for washed apgregate may be waived if gradation test results passing Ne. 200
gieve meet requirement.
1. Cuwrenily The Logan County Bnginesr estimates the qoantity of 422-A chipseal stone for the 2023 program to
be 6,500 tong,
Respectfully submitted,

Company DUFF QUARRY INC.

Address PO BOX 305

HUNTSVILLE, OH 43324

e

By:Q

Title}{b PRESIDENT
Tele

e No. _937-686-2911/




CHIO REVISED CODE
NON -COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

In accordance with Title 23 United States Code, Section 112 and Ohio Revised Code, Chapter 1331 et.
seq: and Sections 2921.11 and 2921.13, the bidder hereby states, under penalty of perjury and under other
such penalties as the law provides, that he or his agents or employees have not entered either direcily o
indirectly into any agreement, participated in any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraint of
free competitive bidding in connection with this proposal. Execution of this proposal on the signature
portion thereof shall constitute also signature of this Non-Collusion Affidavit

{AMPAIGN CONTRIBUTIONS AFFIDAVIT

Obio Revised Code Section 3517 13()) requires that no agency or department of thig state or any political
subdivigion shall award any coniract, other than one let by competitive bidding or a contract incidental to
such contract or which is by force account, for the purchase of goods costing more than five hundred

- dollars or services costing more than five hundred dollars to any individual, partnership, association,
including, without limitation, a professional association organized under Chapter 1785 of the ORC, estate,
or trust if the individual has made or the individual’s spouse has made, or any partier, shareholder,
administrator, executor, or trustee or the speuse of any of them has made, as an individual, within the ftwo
previous calendar years, one or more contributions totaling in excess of one thousand dollats to the holder
of the public office having ultimate responsibility for the award of the contract or fo the public officer’s
campaign committee. Furthermore, Ohio Revised Code Section 3517.13(T) requires that no agency or
department of this state or any political subdivision shall awatd any contract, other than one let by
competitive bidding or a contract incidental to such contract ot which is by force account, for the purchase
of goods costing mote than five hundred dollars or services costing more than five hundred dollars to a
corporation or business frust, exeept a professional association organized under Chapter 1785 of the ORC,
if an owner of more than twenty per cent of the corporation or business trust or the spouse of that person
has made, as an individual, within the two previous calendar years, taking into consideration only owners
for all of that period, one or more contributions totaling in excess of one thousand dollars to the holder of
a public office having ultimate responsibility for the award of the contract or to the public officst’s
campaign committee. Execution of this proposal on the signature portion thereof shall constitute also
signature of this Campaign Contributions A ffidavit.




COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S
PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX A¥FIDAVIT
LOGAN COUNTY, OHIO (R.C. 5719.042)
STATE OF OHIO:
1 58;
LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in,
or with Logan County, Ohio, and that: (Check appropriate lines)

He is a sole proprietorship deing business under hiz owm name.

He is a sole proprictorship doing business under the name of

He is & genera) partner of the parinership known as

X __ He is a duly authorized officer of the corporation named _ DUFF QUARRY INC.

The business address of the bidder is 9042 STATE ROUTE 117, HUNTSVILLE, OH 43324

; Telephone  937-686-4313

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or it bid:
X Was noi charged with any delinquent personal taxes in Logan County, Ohio.

Was charged with delinguent personal property taxes as follows:

YEAR AMOUNT PENALTY INTEREST
20 $ H $
20 $ $
20 $ 3 H

Signed: Q‘ W

Title: g/{'f?\-ﬁ) ST i/-(/] /




STATE OF OHIO:
88
LOGAN COUNTY :
Before me, a notary, in and for said county, personally appeared

J._DAerD DU (scle proprietor doing business under his own name)

{sole proprietor doing business under the name of )

{general parmer of the Partnership known as )

{duly authorized officer of the Corporation name _ DUFEF QUARRY INC. ),

who acknowledged that he is authorized in the premises and that his signing of this instrument is
the free act and deed of himself or the organization which he represents.
In sestimony whereof, I have hereunto subscribed my name and affixed my official seal at

HUNTSVILLE  ,Ohio,this__ 9  dayof JAN. , 2 023

) ' STEVEN W. FRILLING
/é&)‘pf" (s 131 /“-'Z‘Iz‘ﬂ NOTABY RUBLIC, STATE OF OHIO
Nmary Public f My Commisslen Eaplm.“f.rw_ig?.

COMMISSIONERS:
No delinquent taxes — file
Delinquent taxes - sent to County Engineer

Cleik




2023
STONE AND GRAVEL
BIDDER’S LIST

Duff Quarry, Inc.
scottdutfi@ohioreadvmix.com
G2 S.R. 117

Huntsville, OH 43324

Neer's Sand & Gravel
4859 Rd. 45
Bellefontaine, OH 43311

neersanderavel @yahoo.com

Shelly Materialg, Inc,

Attn: Shawn Scott

shéwn. scottf@shellveo. com
1700 Fostoria Ave., Suite 200
P.O,. Box 3100

Findlay, Ohio 45840

Dayton Bailders Bxchange
info@bxohio.com




(entlemen:

January 13 , 2023

We hereby submit the following bids for products produced at out plant located at 1558 CR 105

Bslle Center, OH 43310

for the year 2023.

These prices are for the merchandise F.0.B. your trucks as follows:

STONE & GRAVEL FRODUCTS
Tarms: Net 30
No. 1 3 nm per ton
No.2 5 1250 pet ton
No. 4 3 1260 pet Ton
No, 422 -A § ne per ton
No. 6 § 1500 per ton
No. 67 § nm per tan
No. B $ 2500 per ton
No.9 $ nw pet ton
Ne. 310 $ wnm per ton
No. 304 $ 1500 per ton
No. 617 § 1500 per ton
RipRap (A,B,C & D) § s200 per fon
OTHER SIZES PRODUCED
Tce Grits 5 ne per ton
Quarry Rack 3 NEB per ton
Flat Rock $ N per ton
Bank Run § wa per ton
Boulderz § NmB perton
NOTE:
1. The Logan County Fogineer may request up to 5 individual gradation test on the stockpiled No. 422-A
chipseal stone verifying sieve analysis with the QDOT 2019 CMS 422.02-1 (Type A) for material acceptance..
2. CUMS 422.02 - the specification for washed agpregaie may be waived if gradation test results passing No. 200
sieve meef requirement.
3. Cutrently The Logan Coumty Engineer estimates the quantity of 422-A chipeeal etone for the 2023 program to
be 6,569 tons.
Respectfully submitted,

Company Shelly Materials

Address 1558 County Rd. 105

Belle Cenler, OH 43310

By: Shawn Scoft
Tifle: _ Sales Representative

Telephone Neo. _ 419-466-6750




NOTICE FOR BIDS

Notice is hereby given that bids will be received at the Logan County Commissioners Office, 117 B.
Columbus Avenue, Suite 100, Bellefontaine, Ohio until 11:00 A M., Ohio Standard Time, Thursday,
January 19, 2023 for the furnishing of commercially produced STONE AND GRAVEL of various sizes
required for the general construction and maintenance of Logan County Highways during the year 2023
according to specifications on file in the Logan County Commissioner's Office.

Bids accepted on furnished blanks only.

Specifications and blanks may be obtained at the Logan County Commissioner's Office.

Bids o be submitted on @ unit price basis,

Proposals are to be a FIRM FIX PRICE FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR from the award date,

Bids to be submiited on F.O.B. our trucks basis,

* Bids will be awarded to lowest and best bidder taking into consideration, hau] distance and ronte, type of
proposed project, and availability of material.

Bidders must comply with the provisions of the American with Disabilities Act of 1990.
All proposals to be in accondance with Sections 307.86 to 307.92 inclusive of the Chio Revised Code.

Aggregate products shall conform to the Construction and Material Specifications of the Stafe of Ohio,
dated January 1, 2019.

The Notice to Bidders is posted on the Internet and may be viewed on Logan County’s web page at-
www.lceo.usfengineer/Bid_Documents/index html

The Logan County Board of Commissioners reserves the right to reject any and all bids and to waive any
defects in bids.

Board of County Commissioners
Logan County, Ohio
DeDe Doss, Clerk/Admin.

Posted: Janwary 05, 2023
Advertised:  January 05, 2023; January 12, 2023




COMPETTTIVE BIDDER'S
PERSGNAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT
LOGAN COUNTY, OHIO (R.C. 5719.042)
STATE OF OHIO:
1 88
LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in,
or with Logan County, Ohio, and that: (Check appropriate lines)

He is a sole proprietorship doing business onder his own name.

He is a sole proprietorship doing business under the name of

He is a general partner of the partnership known as

X Heis a duly authorized officer of the corporation named The Shelly Company

; Telephone 419-466-8750

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submifting his or its bid:
X Was not charged with any delinquent personal taxes in Logan County, Ohio.

Was charged with delinquent personal property taxes as follows:

YEAR AMOUNT PENALTY INTEREST
w0 $ 5 $
20 $ S
20 $ - $
Signed: % /« %
T __/

Title: Sales Representative




OHIO REVISED CODE
NON -COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

In accordanee with Title 23 United States Code, Section 112 and Ohio Revised Code, Chapfer 1331 et.
seq: and Sections 2921.11 and 2921.13, the bidder hereby states, under penalty of perjury and under other
such penalties as the law provides, that he or his agents or employees have not entered either directly ar
indirectly info any agreement, participated in any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraint of
free competitive bidding in connection with this proposal. Execution of this proposal on the signatore
portion thereof shall constitute also signature of this Non-Collusion Affidavit

CAMPAIGN CONTRIBUTIONS AFFIDAVIT

Ohio Revised Code Section 3517.13(I) requires tha? ne agency or department of this state or any political
subdivision shall award any contract, other than one let by competitive bidding or a contract incidental to
such: contrait or which is by force account, for the purchase of goods costing more than five hondred
dollars or services costing more than five hundred dollars to any individual, partnership, association,
includirig, without lfsitation, a profesgional association organized under Chapter 1785 ofthe ORC, estate,
or trust if the individual has made or the individual’s spouse has made, or any partner, shareholdet,
administrator, executor, or trustee or the spouse of any of them has made, as an individual, within the two
previous calendar years, one or more contributions totaling in excess of one thousand dollars to the holder
of the public office having ultimate responsibility for the award of the contract or to the public officer’s
campaign committee. Furthermore, Ohie Revised Code Section 3517.13(J) requires that no agency or
departraent of this state or any political subdivision shall. awerd any contract, other than one let by
competitive bidding or a contract incidental to such contract or which is by force account, for the purchase
of goods costing more than five hundred dollars or services costing more than five hundred doflars to a
corporation or business trust, except a professional association organized under Chapter 1785 of the ORC,
if an owner of more than twenty per cent of the corporation or business frust or the sponse of that person
has made, as an individual, within the two previous calendar years, taking info consideration only owners
for all of that period, one or more contributions totaling in excess of one thousand dellars to the holder of
a public office having ultimate responsibility for the award of the contract or to the public officer’s
campaign committee. Execution of this proposal on the signature portion thereof shall constitute also
signature of this Campaign Contributions Affidavit.




STATE OF OHIO:
N
LOGAN COUNTY :
Before me, a notary, in and for said county, personally appeared

Shawn Scott (sole praprietor doing business under his own name)

{(sole proprieter doing business under the name of )

{general partner of the Parmetship known as )

{duly authorized officer of the Corporation name The Shelly Company ),

who acknowledged that he is authorized in the premises and that his signing of this instrument is
f

the free act and deed of himself or the organization which he represents.

In testimony whereof, T have hereunto subscribed my name and afﬁxed g&?gjﬁmal seal at

HPE A DS ,Ohio, this \% da}rof:!,ﬁjﬁﬂﬁ j ,20'2-'5

tary Public

COMMISSIONERS:
No delinquent taxes — file
Delinquent taxes - sent to County Engineer

Cletk
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2023
STONE AND GRAVEL

BIDDER’S LIST

Duif Quarry, Inc.
scoitdufiimohioreadymix. com
o042 S.R. 117

Huntsville, OH 43324

Neer's Sand & Gravel

4859 Rd. 45 '
Bellefontaine, OF 43311
peersandgravel@yahoo. com

Shelly Materials, Inc.

Afim: Shawn Scott
shawn.scott@shellyco.com
1700 Fostoria five., Suite 200
P.O.Bo¥3 100

- Findlay;. Ohig45840
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